
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

ANTI-SOCIAL BEHAVIOUR, CRIME AND 
POLICING ACT 2014 

 
 

 
 

PUBLIC SPACES PROTECTION ORDERS (PSPO) COVERING 
CONSUMPTION OF ALCOHOL  

 
The South Hams District Council (in this Order called “the council”) being 
satisfied that the conditions within Section 59 (2) and (3) of the above Act are 
met, do make the following order to control anti-social behaviour associated 
with the consumption of alcohol, and requires that any person within the 
PSPO area; shall surrender any open vessel containing alcohol to an 
authorised person when requested to do so by that authorised person. 
 
The PSPO area is defined as being the land described in the Schedule below 
and shown in red on the maps attached to this Order, being land in the area of 
the Council. 
 
This Order may be cited as the South Hams District Council Public Spaces 
Protection Order (Alcohol) 2021 and shall come into force on 15th July 2021 
 

SCHEDULE   
 

Dartmouth 
Coronation Park, Royal Avenue Gardens, New Ground Car Park, Footways 
immediately adjacent to both of the above, being part of North Embankment, 
Coombe Road, College Way and Mayor’s Avenue, Manor Gardens and from 
the embankment edge of the Boatfloat to the greenhouses in Mayors Avenue.  
Victoria Road Park, Collingwood Road Park and Britannia Avenue Park. 
 
 
Ivybridge 
Public Highway (including all carriageways, footways and footpaths and open 
spaces): Fore Street (throughout), Marjorie Kelly Way (throughout), Leonards 
Road (throughout) Glanvilles Road, Glanvilles Mill, the area bounded by 
Leonards Road; Fore Street ;and Marjorie Kelly way. Playground off St. Johns 
Close. Woodlands Park. Victoria Park. MacAndrews Field. Filham Park. The 
underpass of the A38. Playing fields known as Erme Playing Fields. 
 
Kingsbridge 
Recreation Ground. Town Square (excluding area adjacent Creek’s End), 
Britton’s Field. Duncombe Park including entrance car park area, children’s 



play area, central grassed area and terraces, Bridge Street (to junction with 
Church Close), Promenade/Embankment Road (west side) grassed and 
surfaced area adjacent toilets to end of grassed/surfaced area beyond 
Memorial Shelter, Bus station and footpath opposite pharmacy, Prince of 
Wales Road. Library – Steps/ramp and paved area in front of Library. 
Kingsbridge Town Council – Quay House grounds. Lower Union Road, Devon 
Square, Mill Street, Fore Street. Derby Road Industrial Estate. 
 
Salcombe 
Baptist Lane, Chapel End, Cliff House Gardens, Cliff Road – adjacent to Cliff 
House Gardens, Clifton Place including the slipway, Courtenay Park, Cross 
Park Gardens, the perimeter of roads of Cross Park Gardens from Courtenay 
Street to Devon Road, Courtenay Street, Customhouse Quay including all 
landing stages and slipways, Ferry Pier and Steps including the landing stage, 
also the unnamed passage and steps running south from the Ferry Steps to 
the foreshore, Folly Lane, Fore Street, Fore Street – Footway in front of Nos 
74 to 76, Fore Street – Area leading to Kings Court, Market Street, Robinsons 
Row, Union Street, Victoria Place and Quay including all landing stages and 
slipways, Whitestrand Car Park and Quay including the pontoon, slipway and 
steps. Victoria Quay as far as Island Street. Island Street. Gould Road. 
Shadycombe Road. Shadycombe Road Car Park. Creek Car and Boat Park. 
Cross Park. 
 
Totnes 
Fore Street, High Street, Rotherfold, Cistern Street (excluding south of 
Rotherfold), Leechwell Street, Church Close Guildhall Yard, Ramparts Walk, 
footpath adjacent to Civic Hall car park, Civic Square, The Plains, Coronation 
Road (to the entrance of the Fire Station). Open space at Rotherfold, Civic  
Hall car park, St Mary’s churchyard, The Lamb and Heath’s Gardens, the 
footpath from Coronation Road to Babbage Road, pedestrianised area around 
Town Mill, forecourt of Totnes United Free Church, Vire Island, Town Quay, 
Symons Passage. Steamer Quay Car Park and adjacent road. Longmarsh 
park area. 
 
 
Dated……………………… 
  
 
 
THE COMMON SEAL OF  
SOUTH HAMS DISTRICT 
was hereunto affixed in the  
presence of: 
 
 
 
 
Andy Bates 
Chief Executive 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 


